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Carter) were considerably wealthier and better educated than last- 
minute deciders (who gave Carter a 60 percent majority) but somewhat 
below precampaign deciders (who went 59 to 41 percent for Ford) in 
social and economic status. Further, campaign deciders were more 
likely to be ideological neutrals than were precampaign deciders and 
last-minute deciders. 

Campaign deciders base their choices on reports on TV and in the 
press, say Chafee and Choe. The amount of reading they did about 
politics in 1976 jumped between Labor Day and October, while the 
other groups' interest in political coverage tailed off considerably. 

Diehard Democrats and Republicans fall in line behind their candi- 
dates soon after the nominating conventions, observe the authors. But 
once the party nominees are chosen, a large bloc of uncommitted Amer- 
icans steep themselves in campaign coverage and base their choices on 
the candidates' views and performances. 

Housing Test "Housing Allowances: An Experiment 
That Worked" by Bernard J .  Frieden, in 
The Public Interest (Spring 1980) Box 542, 
Old Chelsea, New York, N.Y. 1001 1. 

Providing the poor with good quality housing has been a high priority 
of the federal government since the New Deal era. But a recent federal 
experiment suggests that low-income people are troubled most by high 
rents. So reports Frieden, a professor of urban studies at MIT. 

Beginning in 1973, the Department of Housing and Urban Develop- 
ment offered cash payments averaging $75 a month to poor tenants 
whose annual income came to less than $7,000 (for a family of four). 
Recipients could spend the money as they pleased, provided they lived 
in or moved to housing that met sanitary and safety standards set by 
HUD. 

The seven-year experiment involved more than 25,000 families in 12 
metropolitan areas and cost $160 million. As planned, the lowest in- 
come families received the greatest assistance. The average recipient 
family earned only $4,000 (in 1976 dollars). The payments reduced the 
rent burden of poor families from between 34 and 53 percent of total 
income to between 17 and 30 percent. 

However, less than half the families eligible for the new program 
applied. Reasons given included a reluctance to move from homes that 
failed federal inspections and an unwillingness to accept "handouts." 
Homeowning recipients used the allowances to make minor repairs, 
but only about 40 percent of the participating families moved to secure 
better housing. On the average, families spent only 20 percent of their 
additional income on rent. 

"The poor do not give quality the high priority that program adminis- 
trators do," says Frieden. In fact, just as the experiment began, an HUD 
poll revealed that 84 percent of poor families rated their homes "excel- 
lent" or "satisfactory." 
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